



**THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT**

BID/RFP AWARD NOTICE

DATE:
March 31, 2023

BID/RFP TITLE & REFERENCE:
Breakfast and Lunch Entrees, Bid #231002

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

An annual pricing agreement with a one (1) year renewal option to provide breakfast and lunch entrees for use in the preparation of school lunches as stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse for school cafeterias throughout the District. Seventy (70) items bid, sixty-two (62) items recommended for award(s). Eight (8) items were not awarded are due to no bids received and/or samples not meeting specifications. Items will be purchased as needed to meet cafeteria usage requirements. Recommend bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.

Effective Dates: May 1, 2023 through April 30, 2024.

REQUESTED BY:

Food Services

SUPPLIER NAME:	ITEMS AWARDED:	ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE:
Bake Crafters Food Co., McDonald, TN	3	\$ 264,154.00
Butler Foods of Pensacola, Cantonment, FL	3	382,834.00
Churchfield Trading Co., Santa Ynez, CA	1	110,200.00
Don Lee Farms, Inglewood, CA	2	361,800.00
Foster Poultry & Farms, Livingston, CA	1	164,160.00
Gold Creek Foods, Gainesville, GA	2	250,600.00
Hormel Food Sales, Austin, MN	7	675,635.00
John Hicks, Sanford, FL	1	84,436.00
JTM Provisions, Harrison, OH	1	117,360.00
Maid-Rite Specialty Foods, Dunmore, PA	1	67,680.00
Nardone Bros. Baking Co., Wilkes Barre, PA	2	689,450.00
Rich Chick's, Gardena, CA	1	82,775.00
S&F Foods, Romulus, MI	1	120,300.00
Super Bakery, Cleveland, OH	3	343,752.00
Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL	24	1,650,470.00
Tropical Paradise, Bedford, MA	1	156,000.00
Tyson, Springdale, AR	8	1,427,809.00

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:

\$6,949,415.00 Est. / Yr.

FUNDING SOURCE:

Food Services Fund (4110)

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:

ECSD Bid

Bids Received: 24

Bids Rejected: 0

DATE AND TIME POSTED:

March 31, 2023, 10:55 a.m. Central Time

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505
BID TABULATION

Awarded Items are Highlighted

BID NBR: 231002
BID TITLE: Breakfast and Lunch Entrees
DATE: March 31, 2023

Item No.	Vendor	Bake Crafters Food Co. McDonald, TN	Butler Foods of Pensacola, Inc. Cantonment, FL	Churchfield Trading Co., Santa Ynez, CA	Dave's Baking Co., Santa Monica, CA	Don Lee Farms, Inglewood, CA	ES Foods, Woodbury, NY	Foster Poultry & Farms, Livingston, CA	Gold Creek Foods, Gainesville, GA	Hornel Food Sales, Austin, MN
1	Cereal Bar, Frozen, 2-Grain (0505990)	No Bid		(L,M)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.4188	0.4000						
	Unit Price:		20.10	19.54						
	Extended Price:		\$44,220.00	\$42,988.00						
2	Oatmeal Round Frozen (New Item, No ID#)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.5576							
	Unit Price:		40.15							
	Extended Price:		\$44,165.00							
3	Pastry, Whole Grain (0517060)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.5556							
	Unit Price:		40.00							
	Extended Price:		\$20,000.00							
4	Bagel, Cream Cheese Filled (0516980)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.5417							
	Unit Price:		39.00							
	Extended Price:		\$19,500.00							
5	Pretzel Bites (0517700) - DELETED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
6	Muffin, Variety, Small, Frozen (0517151)	(M)		No Bid	(AY,MY)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	0.3358	0.5083		0.3350					
	Unit Price:	32.24	36.60		30.15/case					
	Extended Price:	\$96,720	\$109,800.00		\$90,450.00					
6	Muffin, Variety, Small, Frozen (0517151)	See Above		No Bid	See Above	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.5113							
	Unit Price:		24.54							
	Extended Price:		\$73,620.00							
7	Muffin, Variety, Small, Shelf Stable (0517151) - DELETED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
8	Mini-Cinnamon Rolls (0517210)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.5568							
	Unit Price:		40.09							
	Extended Price:		\$40,090.00							

Item No.	Vendor	Bake Crafters Food Co. McDonald, TN	Butler Foods of Pensacola, Inc. Cantonment, FL	Churchfield Trading Co., Santa Yenza, CA	Dave's Baking Co., Santa Monica, CA	Don Lee Farms, Inglewood, CA	ES Foods, Woodbury, NY	Foster Poultry & Farms, Livingston, CA	Gold Creek Foods, Gainesville, GA	Hornel Food Sales, Austin, MN
9	Breakfast Bread Slice, Variety Flavors (0517350)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(AU,M)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:				0.6900					
	Unit Price:				19.35					
	Extended Price:				\$23,220.00					
10	Mini Pancakes (0516990)	(AU,M)		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	0.6194	0.5063							
	Unit Price:	44.60	40.50							
	Extended Price:	\$66,900	\$60,750.00							
11	French Toast Sticks (0517010)	(MY)		(AU,M)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	1.9930	2.17/lb	0.5190						
	Unit Price:	19.93	52.05	44.19						
	Extended Price:	\$35,874	\$93,690.00	\$79,542.00						
12	Doughnuts, Frozen (0517091)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(AY,M)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:				0.400					
	Unit Price:				\$28.20					
	Extended Price:				\$169,200.00					
13	Waffles, Mini (0517021)	(M)		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	1.0117	0.5121							
	Unit Price:	45.53	36.87							
	Extended Price:	\$50,993.60	\$25,809.00							
14	Waffle, Dutch (0516490)	No Bid		(L,M)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.5250	0.4500						
	Unit Price:		25.20	22.04						
	Extended Price:		\$126,000.00	\$110,200.00						
15	Texas Toast, Garlic (0517220)	(MY)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	0.2426								
	Unit Price:	29.12								
	Extended Price:	\$157,248.00								
16	Pizza, Whole Grain, Cheese, Round, Individual (0517440)	No Bid	(AU,M)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		1.1323							
	Unit Price:		90.58							
	Extended Price:		\$634,060.00							
17	Pizza, Mexican Style, Without Beans, (0517670)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
18	Cheesy Bread, Pull Apart (0517690)	No Bid	(MY)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.5723							
	Unit Price:		64.10							
	Extended Price:		\$192,300.00							
19	Cheesy Bread, Bite Size (New Item)	No Bid	(MY)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.2935							
	Unit Price:		70.44							
	Extended Price:		\$352,200.00							
20	Ground Beef, Mini Burgers (0515090)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(MY)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:					0.3105				
	Unit Price:					124.20				
	Extended Price:					\$124,200.00				

Item No.	Vendor	Bake Crafters Food Co. McDonald, TN	Butler Foods of Pensacola, Inc. Cantonment, FL	Churchfield Trading Co., Santa Yenza, CA	Dave's Baking Co., Santa Monica, CA	Don Lee Farms, Inglewood, CA	ES Foods, Woodbury, NY	Foster Poultry & Farms, Livingston, CA	Gold Creek Foods, Gainesville, GA	Hormel Food Sales, Austin, MN
21	Ground Beef Patties (0516115)	No Bid	No Bid	(AU,L,M)	No Bid	(MY)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			1.090		0.5940				
	Unit Price:			212.00		118.80				
	Extended Price:			\$424,000.00		\$237,600.00				
22	Taco Meat (0516170)	No Bid	(AU)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		5.51/lb							
	Unit Price:		110.20							
	Extended Price:		\$165,300.00							
23	Beef Meatballs (0516190)	No Bid	(M)	No Bid	No Bid	(M)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.1383 /4.43 lb			0.4875/3.90 lb				
	Unit Price:		44.25			117.00				
	Extended Price:		\$26,550.00			\$70,200.00				
24	Sausage Patty, Turkey (0516210)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(MY)
	Portion Price:									0.2742
	Unit Price:									43.87
	Extended Price:									\$87,740.00
25	Sausage Link, Turkey (0516200) - DELETED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(M)
	Portion Price:									0.2793
	Unit Price:									44.69
	Extended Price:									\$89,380.00
26	Smoked Sausage (0516120)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
27	Pepperoni, Turkey, Sliced (0512140)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(MY)
	Portion Price:									0.5073
	Unit Price:									5.91/lb or 118.20/cs
	Extended Price:									\$23,640.00
28	Bacon, Turkey (0517540)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(MY)
	Portion Price:									0.1623
	Unit Price:									97.35
	Extended Price:									\$9,735.00
29	Deli Style Turkey Ham, Sliced (0516220)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(MY)
	Portion Price:									0.7684
	Unit Price:									47.64
	Extended Price:									\$33,348.00
30	Deli Style Turkey Ham, Whole (0516220) - DELETED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
31	Roast Turkey Breast, Sliced (0516340)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(MY)
	Portion Price:									0.7538
	Unit Price:									72.36
	Extended Price:									\$50,652.00
32	Turkey Breast (0516312)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(MY)
	Portion Price:									0.8982
	Unit Price:									4.89/lb or 220.05/cs
	Extended Price:									\$88,020.00

Item No.	Vendor	Bake Crafters Food Co. McDonald, TN	Butler Foods of Pensacola, Inc. Cantonment, FL	Churchfield Trading Co., Santa Yenza, CA	Dave's Baking Co., Santa Monica, CA	Don Lee Farms, Inglewood, CA	ES Foods, Woodbury, NY	Foster Poultry & Farms, Livingston, CA	Gold Creek Foods, Gainesville, GA	Hormel Food Sales, Austin, MN
33	Turkey Pot Roast (0516760) - DELETED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
34	Grilled White Chicken Patty (0516562)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(L,MU)	No Bid
	Portion Price:								0.9000	
	Unit Price:								47.70	
	Extended Price:								\$71,550.00	
35	Chicken Breakfast Patty, Breaded, Whole Grain (0516580)	No Bid	(AU)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(L,MU)	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.5651						0.3750	
	Unit Price:		88.16						30.00	
	Extended Price:		\$17,632.00						\$6,000.00	
36	Breaded Chicken Breast Filets, Spicy, Whole Grain (0516620)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(L,MY)	No Bid
	Portion Price:								0.7930	
	Unit Price:								31.70	
	Extended Price:								\$158,500.00	
37	Breaded Chicken Breast Filets, Whole Grain (0516930)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(L,MY)	No Bid
	Portion Price:								0.7680	
	Unit Price:								30.70	
	Extended Price:								\$92,100.00	
38	Chicken Breast Tenders, Whole Muscle (0516650)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(AY,L,MY)	No Bid
	Portion Price:								1.002	
	Unit Price:								100.20	
	Extended Price:								\$501,000.00	
39	Popcorn Chicken (0516870)	No Bid		(AU,L,M)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(AU,L,M)	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.8430	0.6700					0.6970	
	Unit Price:		87.67	156.88					24.40	
	Extended Price:		\$306,845.00	\$549,000.00					\$85,400.00	
40	Popcorn Chicken, Spicy (0516880)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
41	Grilled Chicken Fajita Meat, Dark (0516690)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(L,MY)	No Bid
	Portion Price:								0.7070	
	Unit Price:								168.96	
	Extended Price:								\$168,960.00	
42	Chicken, 8-Piece Breaded (0516550)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
43	Chicken, 8-Piece Roasted (0516540)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									

Item No.	Vendor	Bake Crafters Food Co. McDonald, TN	Butler Foods of Pensacola, Inc. Cantonment, FL	Churchfield Trading Co., Santa Yenza, CA	Dave's Baking Co., Santa Monica, CA	Don Lee Farms, Inglewood, CA	ES Foods, Woodbury, NY	Foster Poultry & Farms, Livingston, CA	Gold Creek Foods, Gainesville, GA	Hormel Food Sales, Austin, MN
44	Taco Wrap, Meat-Filled, Variety Flavors (0516730) - DELETED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
45	Fish Sticks, Cornmeal Crust (0515051)	No Bid		(L,M)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		3.6500	0.852/3.6200						
	Unit Price:		73.00	72.45						
	Extended Price:		\$146,000.00	\$144,900.00						
46	Fish Portion, Cornmeal Crusted (0515030) - DELETED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
47	Pork, BBQ, Shredded (0516940)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		1.8500							
	Unit Price:		37.00							
	Extended Price:		\$37,000.00							
48	Corn Dog (0516052)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		(AY,MY)	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:							0.5700		
	Unit Price:							41.04		
	Extended Price:							\$164,160.00		
49	Frankfurters, Beef (0516070)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.4638							
	Unit Price:		37.10							
	Extended Price:		\$74,200.00							
50	Frankfurters, Turkey (0516070) - DELETED	No Bid		(L,M)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(M)
	Portion Price:		0.3344	0.4520						0.4200
	Unit Price:		26.75	36.18						67.20
	Extended Price:		\$53,500.00	\$72,360.00						\$67,200.00
51	Toaster Pastries, Whole Grain, Single Count, (0505970)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.3367							
	Unit Price:		40.40							
	Extended Price:		\$121,200.00							
52	Toaster Pastries, Whole Grain, Two Count, (0505980)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.5156							
	Unit Price:		37.12							
	Extended Price:		\$81,664.00							
53	Crispy Biscuit, Shelf Stable (New Item, No ID#)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.3568							
	Unit Price:		42.82							
	Extended Price:		\$42,820.00							
54	Oatmeal Bar, Shelf Stable (New Item, No ID#)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(AY*,L,M)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.3570				0.6500			
	Unit Price:		51.41				78.00			
	Extended Price:		\$51,410.00				\$93,600.00			
55	Cereal Bar, Shelf Stable, 1-Grain (050590)	(MY)		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(AU,L,M)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	0.2701	0.2863				0.4079			
	Unit Price:	48.62	61.85				61.19			
	Extended Price:	\$51,877.54	\$123,700.00				\$78,323.20			

Item No.	Vendor	Bake Crafters Food Co. McDonald, TN	Butler Foods of Pensacola, Inc. Cantonment, FL	Churchfield Trading Co., Santa Yenza, CA	Dave's Baking Co., Santa Monica, CA	Don Lee Farms, Inglewood, CA	ES Foods, Woodbury, NY	Foster Poultry & Farms, Livingston, CA	Gold Creek Foods, Gainesville, GA	Hormel Food Sales, Austin, MN
55	Cereal Bar, Shelf Stable, 1-Grain (050590)	See Above		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	See Above	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.3517							
	Unit Price:		33.76							
	Extended Price:		\$67,520.00							
56	Cereal Bar With Cereal Pieces, Shelf Stable, 1 Grain (0505130)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.3461							
	Unit Price:		33.23							
	Extended Price:		\$66,460.00							
57	Cereals, Ready-To-Eat (0506010)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.3017							
	Unit Price:		28.96							
	Extended Price:		\$173,760.00							
57	Cereals, Ready-To-Eat (0506010)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.3136							
	Unit Price:		30.11							
	Extended Price:		\$180,660.00							
58	Cereals, Ready-To-Eat, Bulk Pack (0506170)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		12.8600							
	Unit Price:		51.42							
	Extended Price:		\$5,142.00							
59	Granola, Bulk Pack (0506180)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		12.4200							
	Unit Price:		49.68							
	Extended Price:		\$39,744.00							
60	Chicken, Chunk, Canned (0504130)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
61	Tuna, Canned (0504100)	No Bid		(L,M)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		13.5000	0.677/10.8400						
	Unit Price:		81.00	65.01						
	Extended Price:		\$4,050.00	\$3,250.50						
62	Taco Shell Bowls (0511190)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:		64.63							
	Extended Price:		\$116,334.00							
63	Fruit Slush, 100% Fruit Juice (0517470)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
64	Raisins, Flavored (0509161)	No Bid		(AY,L,M)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.3150	0.3480						
	Unit Price:		78.75	69.63						
	Extended Price:		\$275,625.00	\$243,705.00						
65	French Fries, Potato Stix (0514321)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		2.5300							
	Unit Price:		75.96							
	Extended Price:		\$75,960.00							

Item No.	Vendor	Bake Crafters Food Co. McDonald, TN	Butler Foods of Pensacola, Inc. Cantonment, FL	Churchfield Trading Co., Santa Yenza, CA	Dave's Baking Co., Santa Monica, CA	Don Lee Farms, Inglewood, CA	ES Foods, Woodbury, NY	Foster Poultry & Farms, Livingston, CA	Gold Creek Foods, Gainesville, GA	Hormel Food Sales, Austin, MN
66	Egg and Cheese Breakfast Pastry, WG (New Item)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(L,MU)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.7454				0.6829			
	Unit Price:		119.27				109.27			
	Extended Price:		\$35,781.00				\$32,781.00			
67	Mini Calzones, Cheese (0516780)	No Bid	(M)	(L,M)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		1.0973	1.0400						
	Unit Price:		52.67	50.07						
	Extended Price:		\$158,010.00	\$150,210.00						
68	Garlic Basil, Chicken Meatballs W/ Mozzarella Cheese (0516180)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
69	Turkey Breast Sticks (0517710)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(MY)
	Portion Price:									0.6375
	Unit Price:									255.00
	Extended Price:									\$382,500.00
70	Peas, Green, Frozen (#514301)	No Bid		(AU,L,M)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		2.1200	0.2640						
	Unit Price:		42.32	31.71						
	Extended Price:		\$33,856.00	\$25,368.00						

Item No.	Vendor	Integrated Food Services, Gardena, CA	John Hicks, Sanford, FL	JTM Provisions, Harrison, OH	Maid-Rite Specialty Foods, Dunmore, PA	Nardone Bros. Baking Co. Inc., Wilkes Barre, PA	National Food Group, Novi, MI	ProView Foods, Syosset, NY	Rich Chicks, Gardena, CA	S&F Foods, Romulus, MI
1	Cereal Bar, Frozen, 2-Grain (0505990)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(AU,L,M)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.3240				0.3800			
	Unit Price:		38.38				51.80			
	Extended Price:		\$84,436.00				\$113,960.00			
2	Oatmeal Round Frozen (New Item, No ID#)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
3	Pastry, Whole Grain (0517060)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
4	Bagel, Cream Cheese Filled (0516980)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
5	Pretzel Bites (0517700) - DELETED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
6	Muffin, Variety, Small, Frozen (0517151)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
7	Muffin, Variety, Small, Shelf Stable (0517151) - DELETED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
8	Mini-Cinnamon Rolls (0517210)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
9	Breakfast Bread Slice, Variety Flavors (0517350)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
10	Mini Pancakes (0516990)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
11	French Toast Sticks (0517010)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
12	Doughnuts, Frozen (0517091)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									

Item No.	Vendor	Integrated Food Services, Gardena, CA	John Hicks, Sanford, FL	JTM Provisions, Harrison, OH	Maid-Rite Specialty Foods, Dunmore, PA	Nardone Bros. Baking Co. Inc., Wilkes Barre, PA	National Food Group, Novi, MI	ProView Foods, Syosset, NY	Rich Chicks, Gardena, CA	S&F Foods, Romulus, MI
13	Waffles, Mini (0517021)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
14	Waffle, Dutch (0516490)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
15	Texas Toast, Garlic (0517220)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
16	Pizza, Whole Grain, Cheese, Round, Individual (0517440)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:					0.8900				
	Unit Price:					53.50				
	Extended Price:					\$374,500.00				
17	Pizza, Mexican Style, Without Beans, (0517670)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:					0.6600				
	Unit Price:					62.99				
	Extended Price:					\$314,950.00				
18	Cheesy Bread, Pull Apart (0517690)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(M)
	Portion Price:									0.7700
	Unit Price:									80.90
	Extended Price:									\$242,700.00
19	Cheesy Bread, Bite Size (New Item)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
20	Ground Beef, Mini Burgers (0515090)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(MU)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:				0.3258					
	Unit Price:				125.10					
	Extended Price:				\$125,000.00					
21	Ground Beef Patties (0516115)	No Bid	No Bid	(MY)	(MY)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.8878	0.6000					
	Unit Price:			173.13	144.00					
	Extended Price:			\$346,260.00	\$288,000.00					
22	Taco Meat (0516170)	No Bid	No Bid	(MY)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.8275/4.88 lb						
	Unit Price:			146.47						
	Extended Price:			\$219,705.00						
22	Taco Meat (0516170)	No Bid	No Bid	(MY)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.6399/3.22 lb						
	Unit Price:			96.62						
	Extended Price:			\$144,930.00						

Item No.	Vendor	Integrated Food Services, Gardena, CA	John Hicks, Sanford, FL	JTM Provisions, Harrison, OH	Maid-Rite Specialty Foods, Dunmore, PA	Nardone Bros. Baking Co. Inc., Wilkes Barre, PA	National Food Group, Novi, MI	ProView Foods, Syosset, NY	Rich Chicks, Gardena, CA	S&F Foods, Romulus, MI
22	Taco Meat (0516170)	No Bid	No Bid	(MY)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.4952/2.61 lb						
	Unit Price:			78.24						
	Extended Price:			\$117,360.00						
23	Beef Meatballs (0516190)	No Bid	No Bid	(MY)	(MY)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.6888/4.22 lb	0.5875/3.76 lb					
	Unit Price:			126.73	112.80					
	Extended Price:			\$76,038.00	\$67,680.00					
24	Sausage Patty, Turkey (0516210)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
25	Sausage Link, Turkey (0516200) - DELETED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
26	Smoked Sausage (0516120)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
27	Pepperoni, Turkey, Sliced (0512140)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
28	Bacon, Turkey (0517540)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
29	Deli Style Turkey Ham, Sliced (0516220)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
30	Deli Style Turkey Ham, Whole (0516220) - DELETED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
31	Roast Turkey Breast, Sliced (0516340)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
32	Turkey Breast (0516312)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
33	Turkey Pot Roast (0516760) - DELETED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
34	Grilled White Chicken Patty (0516562)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									

Item No.	Vendor	Integrated Food Services, Gardena, CA	John Hicks, Sanford, FL	JTM Provisions, Harrison, OH	Maid-Rite Specialty Foods, Dunmore, PA	Nardone Bros. Baking Co. Inc., Wilkes Barre, PA	National Food Group, Novi, MI	ProView Foods, Syosset, NY	Rich Chicks, Gardena, CA	S&F Foods, Romulus, MI
35	Chicken Breakfast Patty, Breaded, Whole Grain (0516580)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		(AY)	No Bid
	Portion Price:							0.2700	0.5800	
	Unit Price:							53.00	91.15	
	Extended Price:							\$10,600.00	\$23,371.79	
36	Breaded Chicken Breast Filets, Spicy, Whole Grain (0516620)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid
	Portion Price:							1.0500	1.1800	
	Unit Price:							84.00	91.95	
	Extended Price:							\$420,000.00	\$477,432.69	
37	Breaded Chicken Breast Filets, Whole Grain (0516930)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(AY)	No Bid
	Portion Price:								1.1700	
	Unit Price:								91.15	
	Extended Price:								\$283,967.30	
38	Chicken Breast Tenders, Whole Muscle (0516650)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(AU)	(AY)	No Bid
	Portion Price:							1.4200	1.1700	
	Unit Price:							84.00	91.15	
	Extended Price:							\$420,000.00	\$227,875.00	
39	Popcorn Chicken (0516870)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid
	Portion Price:							0.5000	0.6800	
	Unit Price:							53.00	72.97	
	Extended Price:							\$185,500.00	\$383,092.50	
40	Popcorn Chicken, Spicy (0516880)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
41	Grilled Chicken Fajita Meat, Dark (0516690)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
42	Chicken, 8-Piece Breaded (0516550)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
43	Chicken, 8-Piece Roasted (0516540)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
44	Taco Wrap, Meat-Filled, Variety Flavors - DELETED (0516730)	(AU)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	0.7200								
	Unit Price:	71.95								
	Extended Price:	\$28,780.00								

Item No.	Vendor	Integrated Food Services, Gardena, CA	John Hicks, Sanford, FL	JTM Provisions, Harrison, OH	Maid-Rite Specialty Foods, Dunmore, PA	Nardone Bros. Baking Co. Inc., Wilkes Barre, PA	National Food Group, Novi, MI	ProView Foods, Syosset, NY	Rich Chicks, Gardena, CA	S&F Foods, Romulus, MI
45	Fish Sticks, Cornmeal Crust (0515051)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
46	Fish Portion, Cornmeal Crusted (0515030) - DELETED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
47	Pork, BBQ, Shredded (0516940)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
48	Corn Dog (0516052)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
49	Frankfurters, Beef (0516070)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(L,MY)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:						0.5900			
	Unit Price:						47.80			
	Extended Price:						\$95,600.00			
50	Frankfurters, Turkey (0516070) - DELETED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
51	Toaster Pastries, Whole Grain, Single Count, (0505970)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
52	Toaster Pastries, Whole Grain, Two Count, (0505980)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
53	Crispy Biscuit, Shelf Stable (New Item, No ID#)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
54	Oatmeal Bar, Shelf Stable (New Item, No ID#)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
55	Cereal Bar, Shelf Stable, 1-Grain (050590)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									

Item No.	Vendor	Integrated Food Services, Gardena, CA	John Hicks, Sanford, FL	JTM Provisions, Harrison, OH	Maid-Rite Specialty Foods, Dunmore, PA	Nardone Bros. Baking Co. Inc., Wilkes Barre, PA	National Food Group, Novi, MI	ProView Foods, Syosset, NY	Rich Chicks, Gardena, CA	S&F Foods, Romulus, MI
56	Cereal Bar With Cereal Pieces, Shelf Stable, 1 Grain (0505130)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
57	Cereals, Ready-To-Eat (0506010)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
58	Cereals, Ready-To-Eat, Bulk Pack (0506170)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
59	Granola, Bulk Pack (0506180)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
60	Chicken, Chunk, Canned (0504130)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
61	Tuna, Canned (0504100)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
62	Taco Shell Bowls (0511190)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
63	Fruit Slush, 100% Fruit Juice (0517470)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
64	Raisins, Flavored (0509161)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(L,M)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:						0.4100			
	Unit Price:						49.75			
	Extended Price:						\$174,125.00			
64	Raisins, Flavored (0509161)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(AU,L,M)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:						0.4300			
	Unit Price:						52.50			
	Extended Price:						\$183,750.00			
65	French Fries, Potato Stix (0514321)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
66	Egg and Cheese Breakfast Pastry, WG (New Item)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									

Item No.	Vendor	Integrated Food Services, Gardena, CA	John Hicks, Sanford, FL	JTM Provisions, Harrison, OH	Maid-Rite Specialty Foods, Dunmore, PA	Nardone Bros. Baking Co. Inc., Wilkes Barre, PA	National Food Group, Novi, MI	ProView Foods, Syosset, NY	Rich Chicks, Gardena, CA	S&F Foods, Romulus, MI
67	Mini Calzones, Cheese (0516780)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(MY)
	Portion Price:									0.8350
	Unit Price:									40.10
	Extended Price:									\$120,300.00
68	Garlic Basil, Chicken Meatballs W/ Mozzarella Cheese (0516180)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	Portion Price:								0.9600	
	Unit Price:								118.25	
	Extended Price:								\$82,775.00	
69	Turkey Breast Sticks (0517710)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									
70	Peas, Green, Frozen (#514301)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:									
	Unit Price:									
	Extended Price:									

Item No.	Vendor	Schwan's Food Service, Marshall, MN	Super Bakery, Cleveland, OH	Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Tropical Paradise, Bedford, MA	Tyson, Springdale, AR
1	Cereal Bar, Frozen, 2-Grain (0505990)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.5208			
	Unit Price:			25.00			
	Extended Price:			\$55,000.00			
2	Oatmeal Round Frozen (New Item, No ID#)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.5069			
	Unit Price:			36.50			
	Extended Price:			\$40,150.00			
3	Pastry, Whole Grain (0517060)	No Bid	No Bid		(M)	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.4979	0.5690		
	Unit Price:			35.85	54.63		
	Extended Price:			\$17,925.00	\$27,315.00		
4	Bagel, Cream Cheese Filled (0516980)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.4840			
	Unit Price:			34.85			
	Extended Price:			\$17,425.00			
5	Pretzel Bites (0517700) - DELETED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:						
	Unit Price:						
	Extended Price:						
6	Muffin, Variety, Small, Frozen (0517151)	No Bid	(MY)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.3082				
	Unit Price:		36.98				
	Extended Price:		\$110,940.00				
7	Muffin, Variety, Small, Shelf Stable (0517151) - DELETED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:						
	Unit Price:						
	Extended Price:						
8	Mini-Cinnamon Rolls (0517210)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.5062			
	Unit Price:			36.45			
	Extended Price:			\$36,450.00			
9	Breakfast Bread Slice, Variety Flavors (0517350)	No Bid	(MY)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.5429				
	Unit Price:		40.71				
	Extended Price:		\$48,852.00				

Item No.	Vendor	Schwan's Food Service, Marshall, MN	Super Bakery, Cleveland, OH	Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Tropical Paradise, Bedford, MA	Tyson, Springdale, AR
10	Mini Pancakes (0516990)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.49375			
	Unit Price:			39.50			
	Extended Price:			\$59,250.00			
11	French Toast Sticks (0517010)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			2.0854			
	Unit Price:			50.05			
	Extended Price:			\$90,090.00			
12	Doughnuts, Frozen (0517091)	No Bid	(MY)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:		0.3833				
	Unit Price:		30.66				
	Extended Price:		\$183,960.00				
13	Waffles, Mini (0517021)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.4548			
	Unit Price:			32.75			
	Extended Price:			\$22,925.00			
14	Waffle, Dutch (0516490)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.4843			
	Unit Price:			23.25			
	Extended Price:			\$116,250.00			
15	Texas Toast, Garlic (0517220)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:						
	Unit Price:						
	Extended Price:						
16	Pizza, Whole Grain, Cheese, Round, Individual (0517440)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:						
	Unit Price:						
	Extended Price:						
17	Pizza, Mexican Style, Without Beans, (0517670)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:						
	Unit Price:						
	Extended Price:						
18	Cheesy Bread, Pull Apart (0517690)	(MY)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	0.6390		0.8159			
	Unit Price:	63.90		58.75			
	Extended Price:	\$191,700.00		\$176,250.00			
19	Cheesy Bread, Bite Size (New Item)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.2854			
	Unit Price:			68.50			
	Extended Price:			\$342,500.00			

Item No.	Vendor	Schwan's Food Service, Marshall, MN	Super Bakery, Cleveland, OH	Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Tropical Paradise, Bedford, MA	Tyson, Springdale, AR
20	Ground Beef, Mini Burgers (0515090)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Portion Price:						0.8806
	Unit Price:						70.45
	Extended Price:						\$70,450.00
21	Ground Beef Patties (0516115)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(AY)
	Portion Price:						0.7419
	Unit Price:						126.12
	Extended Price:						\$252,240.00
22	Taco Meat (0516170)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:						
	Unit Price:						
	Extended Price:						
23	Beef Meatballs (0516190)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Portion Price:						0.6289/4.03 lb
	Unit Price:						40.25
	Extended Price:						\$24,150.00
24	Sausage Patty, Turkey (0516210)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:						
	Unit Price:						
	Extended Price:						
25	Sausage Link, Turkey (0516200) - DELETED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:						
	Unit Price:						
	Extended Price:						
26	Smoked Sausage (0516120)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(AY)
	Portion Price:						0.3353
	Unit Price:						33.53
	Extended Price:						\$10,059.00
27	Pepperoni, Turkey, Sliced (0512140)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:						
	Unit Price:						
	Extended Price:						
28	Bacon, Turkey (0517540)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:						
	Unit Price:						
	Extended Price:						
29	Deli Style Turkey Ham, Sliced (0516220)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:						
	Unit Price:						
	Extended Price:						

Item No.	Vendor	Schwan's Food Service, Marshall, MN	Super Bakery, Cleveland, OH	Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Tropical Paradise, Bedford, MA	Tyson, Springdale, AR
30	Deli Style Turkey Ham, Whole (0516220) - DELETED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:						
	Unit Price:						
	Extended Price:						
31	Roast Turkey Breast, Sliced (0516340)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:						
	Unit Price:						
	Extended Price:						
32	Turkey Breast (0516312)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:						
	Unit Price:						
	Extended Price:						
33	Turkey Pot Roast (0516760) - DELETED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:						
	Unit Price:						
	Extended Price:						
34	Grilled White Chicken Patty (0516562)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
	Portion Price:			0.8611			0.8196
	Unit Price:			46.50			44.26
	Extended Price:			\$69,750.00			\$66,390.00
35	Chicken Breakfast Patty, Breaded, Whole Grain (0516580)	No Bid	No Bid	(AU)	No Bid	No Bid	(AU)
	Portion Price:			0.54487			0.2387
	Unit Price:			85.00			47.73
	Extended Price:			\$17,000.00			\$9,546.00
35	Chicken Breakfast Patty, Breaded, Whole Grain (0516580)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	See Above
	Portion Price:			0.2488			
	Unit Price:			49.75			
	Extended Price:			\$9,950.00			
36	Breaded Chicken Breast Filets, Spicy, Whole Grain (0516620)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
	Portion Price:			1.1000			0.8146
	Unit Price:			88.00			107.53
	Extended Price:			\$440,000.00			\$537,650.00
36	Breaded Chicken Breast Filets, Spicy, Whole Grain (0516620)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	See Above
	Portion Price:			0.8480			
	Unit Price:			112.00			
	Extended Price:			\$560,000.00			

Item No.	Vendor	Schwan's Food Service, Marshall, MN	Super Bakery, Cleveland, OH	Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Tropical Paradise, Bedford, MA	Tyson, Springdale, AR
37	Breaded Chicken Breast Filets, Whole Grain (0516930)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(AY)
	Portion Price:						1.0788
	Unit Price:						124.06
	Extended Price:						\$372,180.00
38	Chicken Breast Tenders, Whole Muscle (0516650)	No Bid	No Bid	(AU)	No Bid	No Bid	
	Portion Price:			4.40/lb			0.9245
	Unit Price:			88.00			110.01
	Extended Price:			\$440,000.00			\$550,050.00
38	Chicken Breast Tenders, Whole Muscle (0516650)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	See Above
	Portion Price:			0.9660			
	Unit Price:			115.00			
	Extended Price:			\$575,000.00			
39	Popcorn Chicken (0516870)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
	Portion Price:			0.5470			0.4781
	Unit Price:			58.00			74.10
	Extended Price:			\$203,000.00			\$259,350.00
39	Popcorn Chicken (0516870)	No Bid	No Bid	(AY)	No Bid	No Bid	See Above
	Portion Price:			0.8460			
	Unit Price:			88.00			
	Extended Price:			\$308,000.00			
39	Popcorn Chicken (0516870)	No Bid	No Bid	(AY)	No Bid	No Bid	See Above
	Portion Price:			0.5030			
	Unit Price:			78.00			
	Extended Price:			\$273,000.00			
40	Popcorn Chicken, Spicy (0516880)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
	Portion Price:			0.4910			0.4654
	Unit Price:			78.00			74.00
	Extended Price:			\$78,000.00			\$74,000.00
41	Grilled Chicken Fajita Meat, Dark (0516690)	No Bid	No Bid	(AU)	No Bid	No Bid	
	Portion Price:			4.20/lb			0.4975
	Unit Price:			42.00			36.32
	Extended Price:			\$42,000.00			\$36,320.00
41	Grilled Chicken Fajita Meat, Dark (0516690)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	See Above
	Portion Price:			0.5340			
	Unit Price:			39.00			
	Extended Price:			\$39,000.00			

Item No.	Vendor	Schwan's Food Service, Marshall, MN	Super Bakery, Cleveland, OH	Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Tropical Paradise, Bedford, MA	Tyson, Springdale, AR
42	Chicken, 8-Piece Breaded (0516550)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
	Portion Price:			1.1600			1.0954
	Unit Price:			95.00			89.82
	Extended Price:			\$380,000.00			\$359,280.00
43	Chicken, 8-Piece Roasted (0516540)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
	Portion Price:			3.3000			3.1500
	Unit Price:			76.00			72.36
	Extended Price:			\$76,000.00			\$72,360.00
44	Taco Wrap, Meat-Filled, Variety Flavors (0516730) - DELETED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:						
	Unit Price:						
	Extended Price:						
45	Fish Sticks, Cornmeal Crust (0515051)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			3.6000			
	Unit Price:			72.00			
	Extended Price:			\$144,000.00			
46	Fish Portion, Cornmeal Crusted (0515030) - DELETED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:						
	Unit Price:						
	Extended Price:						
47	Pork, BBQ, Shredded (0516940)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			1.7375			
	Unit Price:			34.75			
	Extended Price:			\$34,750.00			
48	Corn Dog (0516052)	No Bid	No Bid	(AY)	No Bid	No Bid	(AY)
	Portion Price:			0.8333			0.7708
	Unit Price:			40.00			37.00
	Extended Price:			\$160,000.00			\$148,000.00
49	Frankfurters, Beef (0516070)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(AU)
	Portion Price:						0.5436
	Unit Price:						43.49
	Extended Price:						\$86,980.00
50	Frankfurters, Turkey (0516070) - DELETED	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.3000			
	Unit Price:			24.00			
	Extended Price:			\$48,000.00			
50	Frankfurters, Turkey (0516070) - DELETED	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.8900			
	Unit Price:			71.00			
	Extended Price:			\$142,000.00			

Item No.	Vendor	Schwan's Food Service, Marshall, MN	Super Bakery, Cleveland, OH	Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Tropical Paradise, Bedford, MA	Tyson, Springdale, AR
51	Toaster Pastries, Whole Grain, Single Count, (0505970)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.3200			
	Unit Price:			38.40			
	Extended Price:			\$115,200.00			
52	Toaster Pastries, Whole Grain, Two Count, (0505980)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.2440			
	Unit Price:			35.15			
	Extended Price:			\$77,330.00			
53	Crispy Biscuit, Shelf Stable (New Item, No ID#)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.3345			
	Unit Price:			40.15			
	Extended Price:			\$40,150.00			
54	Oatmeal Bar, Shelf Stable (New Item, No ID#)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.3364			
	Unit Price:			48.45			
	Extended Price:			\$48,450.00			
55	Cereal Bar, Shelf Stable, 1-Grain (050590)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.33125			
	Unit Price:			31.80			
	Extended Price:			\$63,600.00			
56	Cereal Bar With Cereal Pieces, Shelf Stable, 1 Grain (0505130)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.3151			
	Unit Price:			30.25			
	Extended Price:			\$60,500.00			
57	Cereals, Ready-To-Eat (0506010)	No Bid	No Bid	(SA1*)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.28125			
	Unit Price:			27.00			
	Extended Price:			\$40,500.00			
57	Cereals, Ready-To-Eat (0506010)	No Bid	No Bid	(SA2*)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.2822			
	Unit Price:			27.10			
	Extended Price:			\$121,950.00			
58	Cereals, Ready-To-Eat, Bulk Pack (0506170)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			10.61/bag			
	Unit Price:			42.45			
	Extended Price:			\$4,245.00			
59	Granola, Bulk Pack (0506180)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			10.91/bag			
	Unit Price:			43.65			
	Extended Price:			\$34,920.00			

Item No.	Vendor	Schwan's Food Service, Marshall, MN	Super Bakery, Cleveland, OH	Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Tropical Paradise, Bedford, MA	Tyson, Springdale, AR
60	Chicken, Chunk, Canned (0504130)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			14.6600			
	Unit Price:			88.00			
	Extended Price:			\$4,400.00			
61	Tuna, Canned (0504100)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			12.8330			
	Unit Price:			77.00			
	Extended Price:			\$3,850.00			
61	Tuna, Canned (0504100)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			10.8300			
	Unit Price:			65.00			
	Extended Price:			\$3,250.00			
62	Taco Shell Bowls (0511190)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:						
	Unit Price:						
	Extended Price:						
63	Fruit Slush, 100% Fruit Juice (0517470)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	Portion Price:					0.3250	
	Unit Price:					19.50	
	Extended Price:					\$156,000.00	
63	Fruit Slush, 100% Fruit Juice (0517470)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	Portion Price:					0.4300	
	Unit Price:					25.80	
	Extended Price:					\$206,400.00	
63	Fruit Slush, 100% Fruit Juice (0517470)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	Portion Price:					0.3790	
	Unit Price:					22.75	
	Extended Price:					\$182,000.00	
63	Fruit Slush, 100% Fruit Juice (0517470)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	Portion Price:					0.3690	
	Unit Price:					22.15	
	Extended Price:					\$177,200.00	
64	Raisins, Flavored (0509161)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.3000			
	Unit Price:			75.00			
	Extended Price:			\$262,500.00			
65	French Fries, Potato Stix (0514321)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			1.6516/lb			
	Unit Price:			49.55			
	Extended Price:			\$49,550.00			

Item No.	Vendor	Schwan's Food Service, Marshall, MN	Super Bakery, Cleveland, OH	Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Tropical Paradise, Bedford, MA	Tyson, Springdale, AR
66	Egg and Cheese Breakfast Pastry, WG (New Item)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.7125			
	Unit Price:			114.00			
	Extended Price:			\$34,200.00			
67	Mini Calzones, Cheese (0516780)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:						
	Unit Price:						
	Extended Price:						
68	Garlic Basil, Chicken Meatballs W/ Mozzarella Cheese (0516180)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:						
	Unit Price:						
	Extended Price:						
69	Turkey Breast Sticks (0517710)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			0.6750			
	Unit Price:			270.00			
	Extended Price:			\$405,000.00			
70	Peas, Green, Frozen (#514301)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:			1.75/lb			
	Unit Price:			35.00			
	Extended Price:			\$28,000.00			

NOTES:

A- Alternate product

AU - Alternate sample was unacceptable, no sample was sent, or sample was not approved.

AY - Alternate sample was received and approved.

AY* - Item #54, Cherry Granola #03618 and Blueberry Pomegranate Flavors approved

L - Delivery lead time

M- Minimum Order quantity

MU - Minimum order quantity unacceptable

MY - Minimum order quantity approved

SA1* - Split award; 1500 total quantity

SA2* - Split award; 4500 total quantity

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for seventy-two (72) hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the address at: <http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids>.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statutes. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

+

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County Florida Law.

Allison Watson
Allison Watson, Purchasing Director